## **Purchasing Department**

#### Madison County Board of Supervisors 146 West Center Street Canton, Mississippi 39046

601-855-5503 hardy@madison-co.com

#### 27 March 2013

District 1 Supervisor John Bell Crosby

District 2 Supervisor Ronnie Lott

District 3 Supervisor Gerald Steen

District 4 Supervisor Karl Banks

District 5 Supervisor Paul Griffin

Subject: Award Term Bids for Asphalt Products and Services for the Term-Bid Period April 2013 – 30 September 2013

#### Gentlemen:

Attached are copies the recently-opened term bids for asphalt products and services for the six-month period 1 April 2013 – 30 September 2013 along with a bid tabulation.

A few bid highlights of interest:

- The surface asphalt (SC1) price fell \$2.10 per ton, from \$63.80 to \$61.70
- The base asphalt (BB1) price fell \$1 per ton, from \$55 to \$54
- The price to lay-down asphalt increased \$1 per ton, from \$8 to \$9
- The price to haul asphalt increased 5-cents per ton mile, from 18 cents to 23 cents.

I recommend that the Board take the following action:

1. Award the Term Bid for SC-1 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2013 – 30 Sept 2013 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton's price for SC-1 of \$61.70 is \$5.70 per ton more than Dickerson & Bowen's low bid of \$56; however, the round-trip haul distance to Dickerson & Bowen's Jackson plant is 50 miles longer than to APAC-Canton. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and tires and maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to pick-up a ton of SC 1 Type II Asphalt from APAC-Canton is \$62.13 compared to \$63.59 from Dickerson & Bowen-Jackson, making APAC-Canton the "lowest and best bid." The cost per ton picked up is even greater from APAC-Jackson and ADCAMP. Detailed calculations are attached and incorporated as part of this letter by reference.

2. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 ASPAHLT for the period 1 April 2013 – 30 Sept 2013 to Dickerson & Bowen.

- 3. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 ASPAHLT for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 to APAC-Jackson.
- 4. Award the Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton's price for BB-1 of \$54 is \$3 per ton more than APAC-Jackson's low bid of \$51; however, the round-trip haul distance to APAC-Jackson is 55 miles longer than to APAC-Canton. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and truck tires and maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to pick-up a ton of BB 1 Asphalt from APAC-Canton is \$54.43 compared to \$59.14 from APAC-Jackson and \$59.09 from Dickerson & Bowen, making APAC-Canton the "lowest and best bid." Detailed calculations are attached and incorporated as part of this letter by reference.

5. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2013 – 30 Sept 2013 to Dickerson & Bowen.

Note: Dickerson & Bowen's price for BB-1 of \$51.50 50-cents per ton more than APAC-Jackson's lower bid of \$51; however, the round-trip haul distance to APAC-Jackson is 3.8 longer than to APAC-Jackson. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and truck tires and maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to pick-up a ton of BB 1 Asphalt from Dickerson & Bowen is \$59.09 compared to \$59.14 from APAC-Jackson, making APAC-Canton the "lowest and best bid." Detailed calculations are attached and incorporated as part of this letter by reference.

- 6. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 to APAC-Jackson.
- 7. Award the Term Bid for HAULING AND LAYING ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 to ADCAMP.
- 8. Reject the Term Bid of Dickerson & Bowen for HAULING AND LAYING ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 due to the fact that said company's bid does not meet the specifications. The specifications require the awarded bidder to haul and lay asphalt from any asphalt vender specified by the county. Dickerson & Bowen will only haul and lay asphalt from its plant.
- 9. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for HAULING AND LAYING ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 to APAC.
- 10. Award the Term Bid for COLD MIX for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 to APAC-Jackson.

Note: APAC-Jackson's price of \$120 per ton is \$20 more than Dickerson & Bowen's price of \$100 per ton; however, Dickerson & Bowen requires a one-week notice to pick-up cold mix at its Jackson plant. The Road Department normally requires cold mix within 24 hours. The aforementioned fact makes APAC-Jackson the "lowest and best bid."

- 11. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for COLD MIX for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 to Dickerson & Bowen.
- 12. Award the Term Bid for ROAD RECLAMATION for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 to ADCAMP.
- 13. Reject the Term Bid for LIQUID ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 from ERGON due to the fact that the specifications required a delivered per-gallon price with no minimum quantity stated while the company's bid price is for a full tanker truckload (5,500 gallons plus). The Road Department often only requires approximately 3,500 gallons to fill its on-site tank. This is the action recommended by the State Auditor's office.
- 14. Reject the Term Bid of Blackledge Emulsions for LIQUID ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2013 30 Sept 2013 due the fact that the specifications required a delivered per-gallon price with no minimum quantity stated. Blackledge's bid price does not state a minimum quantity; however, the company's representative stated to me that the price would increase for less than a full tanker truckload (5,500 gallons plus). The Road Department often only requires approximately 3,500 gallons to fill its on-site tank. This is the action recommended by the State Auditor's office.
- 15. Per the State Auditor's recommendation, re-bid for liquid asphalt with specifications requiring separate bid prices for less than a tanker truck load and for a full tanker truck load.

Thank you in advance for your consideration of the above recommendations

Sincerely,

Purchase Clerk

#### ASPHALT TABULATION FOR 1 APRIL 2013 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2013

ASPHALT TABULATION FOR 1 APRIL 2013 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2013						
PRIMARY TERM BID	Terry May	Terry May	Don Gleen	Ralph Barnes		
FIRST ALTERNATE TERM BID	O: 376-4000	O: 376-4000	O: 346-7368	O: 939-4493		
2ND ALTERNATE TERM BID	F: 376-4055	F: 376-4055	F: 346-7152	C: 940-1343		
	john.may@apa	ac.com	dongleen@	ralph@		
			bellsouth.net	adcampinc.com		
SC 1 TYPE II PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT	APAC	APAC	Dickerson	ADCAMP		
	Canton	Jackson	Jackson	Rankin		
Miles to Road Department	1.5	28.2	26.3	30		
		**************************************				
SC 1 Type II Asphalt	\$61.70	\$58.00	\$56.00	\$60.00		
Round Trip Miles	3	56.4	52.6	60		
X \$2.02 Per Mile Freight Cost	\$6.06	\$113.93	\$106.25	\$121.20		
Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up	\$0.43	\$8.14	\$7.59	\$8.66		
Cost per ton picked-up	\$62.13	\$66.14	\$63.59	\$68.66		
BB 1 PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT	APAC	APAC	Dickerson	ADCAMP		
	Canton	Jackson	Jackson	Rankin		
Miles to Road Department	1.5	28.2	26.3	29		
BB 1 ASPHALT	\$54.00	\$51.00	\$51.50	\$58.00		
Round Trip Miles	3	56.4	52.6	60		
X \$2.02Per Mile Freight Cost	\$6.06	\$113.93	\$106.25	\$121.20		
Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up	\$0.43	\$8.14	\$7.59	\$8.66		
Cost per ton picked-up	\$54.43	\$59.14	\$59.09	\$66.66		
HAULING & LAYING ASPHALT	APAC		Dickerson	ADCAMP		
			Jackson	Rankin		
LAYING	\$13.65	5	\$13.20	\$9.00		
HAULING	0.28	3	0.2	0.23		
	3.415.115.41 IS 4.60		THEIR ACRUMET	2.412.112.41.12.4.00		
	MINIMUM \$3		THEIR ASPHALT	MINIMUM \$3		

#### **COLD MIX**

APAC
Jackson
\$120.00

Dickerson

McComb week notice
\$100.00 in Jackson
no notice Brookhaven

228-863-3878 BLACKLEDGE \$1.98000 absorbed

#### **ROAD RECLAMATION**

4 Inches 8 Inches 12 Inches 18 Inches 24 Inches \$12.00 \$15.00 \$20.00 \$25.00 \$32.00

	601-933-3000
LIQUID ASPHALT	ERGON
CRS-2	\$2.33500
Federal Enviromental Fee	\$0.00133

DELIVERED TO ROAD DEPT \$2.33633 \$2.14000
65 miles 182 miles
REJECT REJECT

## ESTIMATE OF COSTS PER MILE TO OPERATE DUMP TRUCKS FOR THE PERIOD 1 APRIL 2013 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2013

TOTAL COST PER MILE	\$2.02
AVERAGE DRIVER WAGES & BENEFITS AVERAGE MILES DRIVEN PER HOUR DRIVER COST PER MILE	\$21.74 30 \$0.72
DIESEL PRICE PER GALLON DIESEL COST PER MILE OTHER COSTS PER MILE (TIRES, REPAIRS, ETC) TOTAL TRUCK COST PER MILE	\$3.34 \$0.74 \$0.55 \$1.29
AVERAGE MPG FOR DUMP TRUCK	4.5

Notes: "Other costs-per-mile" to operate our dump trucks has increased due to the fact that our trucks are higher mileage and no longer under the bumper-to-bumper warranty.

Diesel price is based upon most recent Fuelman bill

Driver wages and benefits based upon cost figures from payroll clerk

"Other costs" is based upon purchase orders issued for tires, repairs, parts, etc.

HARDY CRUNK, PURCHASE CLERK 3.25/2013

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2013 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2013.

## ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 25 MARCH 2013

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

SC 1 Type II Asphalt		\$61.70	per ton	
BB 1 Asphalt		\$54%	per ton	
Cold Mix		<b></b>	per ton	
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Deliver	ed		per gallon	
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)				
4 (four) inch depth		per square	yard	
8 (eight) inch depth		per square	yard	
12 (twelve) inch depth		per square	yard	
18 (eighteen) inch depth		per square	yard	
24 (twenty-four) inch depth		per square	yard	
COMPANY NAME: APAGE Continued on next page	Culissis	sippi, Tuc.		

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid,	note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Stora	age Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: 1.5	Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period, which runs from 1 March 2013 – 30 September 2013. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: APAC-Wississippi, Inc.
ADDRESS: 1.0. Box 24508
Tackson, ells 39225-4508
TELEPHONE: 601-376-4000
FAX NUMBER: 601-376-4055
EMAIL: john. way e apac. com
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE 3/19/13  DATE
TERRY MAY
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The above prices are FOB APAC'S Chuten, lls plant location ilm

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2013 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2013.

## ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 25 MARCH 2013

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

SC 1 Type II Asphalt			5800	_ per ton
BB 1 Asphalt	4	51.5	x0 1954-00	_per ton / W
Cold Mix			120 49	_ per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivere	ed			_ per gallon
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)				
4 (four) inch depth			_per square	yard ·
8 (eight) inch depth			per square	yard
12 (twelve) inch depth			per square	yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth			per square	yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth			per square	yard
COMPANY NAME: APAC-A	Miššišć	sippi, -	Fuc.	

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the Madison County Road Department: \_\_\_\_\_\_\_\_\_Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period, which runs from 1 March 2013 – 30 September 2013. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: APAC-Mississippi, Inc.
ADDRESS: P.O. Box 24508
Jackson, Us 392254508
TELEPHONE: 601-376-4000
FAX NUMBER: 601-576-4055
EMAIL: john. may eapac.com
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE  3-19-13  DATE
TERRY May
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN

AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE
The above prices are FOB APAC'S Jackson, lls plant location.
They lle

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2013 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2013.

## ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 25 MARCH 2013

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

SC 1 Type II Asphalt	-		*56.00	per ton
BB 1 Asphalt	-		5150	per ton
Cold Mix	-	.5	10000	per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivere	ed	NO	Bid	per gallon
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay	y Item will be	e pre	square yar	rd)
4 (four) inch depth	No Bid		per square	yard
8 (eight) inch depth	No Bid		per square	yard
12 (twelve) inch depth	No Bid		per square	yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth	No Bid		per square	yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth	No Bid		per square	yard
COMPANY NAME: Dia Continued on next page	Kersou & Bo	wes	Ac.	

For use in our calculation of Lowest a	nd Best Bid, no	ote here the
Number of Miles from Your Company	Plant/Storage	Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: _	26.3	Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period, which runs from 1 March 2013 – 30 September 2013. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:	Dickersout Bows Inc.	
ADDRESS:	P.O. Box 1008	
	Brookhaues, Ms. 39602	
TELEPHONE:	(601) 969-2002	
FAX NUMBER:	(601) 969-2004	
EMAIL:	gleun ebell south. Net	
AUTHORIZED REPRI	ESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	_5/ <i>c</i> s//3
De L. Gle va		DATE

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2013 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2013.

## ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 25 MARCH 2013

### MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

SC 1 Type II Asphalt	-	\$60.00	per ton	
BB 1 Asphalt	-	\$58.00	per ton	
Cold Mix	-	NO BID	per ton	
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivere	ed .	NO BID	per gallon	
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)				
4 (four) inch depth	\$12.00	per squai	e yard	
8 (eight) inch depth	\$15.00	per squar	re yard	
12 (twelve) inch depth	\$20.00	per squar	re yard	
18 (eighteen) inch depth	\$25.00	per squar	re yard	
24 (twenty-four) inch depth	\$32.00	per squa	re yard	
COMPANY NAME:  Continued on next page	ADCAMP,	INC.		

For use in our calculation of Lowest a	nd Best I	Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Compan	y Plant/S	torage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: _	30	Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period, which runs from 1 March 2013 – 30 September 2013. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY	NAME:	ADCAMP, INC.
ADDRESS:	PHYSICAL:	1353 FLOWOOD DRIVE, FLOWOOD, MS 39232
_	MAILING:	P. O. BOX 54246, JACKSON, MS 39288-4246
TELEPHON	Ė:	601-939-4493
FAX NUMB	ER:	601-939-4676
EMAIL:	ralph@adca	mp, inc.com
AUTHORIZ	Ran ED REPRE	SENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
	RALPH BARN	ES, PRESIDENT

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

### HAULING & LAYING OF ASPHALT TERM BID PERIOD 1 APRIL 2013 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2013

## ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 25 MARCH 2013

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE SECOND FLOOR, ROOMS 225-227 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

#### BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

This term bid is for Hauling & Laying of BB1 and SC1 Asphalt for selected road projects to be undertaken by Madison County. This term bid does not apply to specifically advertised and bid road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county's designated asphalt vendor(s) and hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling		\$0.23	per ton-mile
, 1		WITH \$3.00 MIN	IIMUM HAUL
Laying		\$9.00	per ton

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded this term bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for Hauling and Laying of Asphalt that it will provide said services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of the term bid period, which runs from 1 April 2013 – 30 September 2013.

COMPANY NAME:	ADCAMP, INC.	

Continued on next page

COMPANY NAME:	ADCAMP, INC.	
ADDRESS:	P. O. BOX 54246	
	JACKSON, MS 39288-4246	
TELEPHONE:	601-939-4493	
FAX NUMBER:	601-939-4676	
EMAIL: ralph@adcampinc.c	СОШ	
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTA	Samer ATIVE'S SIGNATURE	MARCH 25, 2013 DATE
RALPH BARNES, PRES	SIDENT	

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

### HAULING & LAYING OF ASPHALT TERM BID PERIOD 1 APRIL 2013 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2013

## ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 25 MARCH 2013

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE SECOND FLOOR, ROOMS 225-227 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

This term bid is for Hauling & Laying of BB1 and SC1 Asphalt for selected road projects to be undertaken by Madison County. This term bid does not apply to specifically advertised and bid road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county's designated asphalt vendor(s) and hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling

Laying

per ton-mile 3 per ton-mile 3 per ton-mile 4 13 5 per ton 400 ton minimum per day.

The below signed company correct that if it is a wall of the signed as that if it is a wall of the signed as th

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded this term bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for Hauling and Laying of Asphalt that it will provide said services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of the term bid period, which runs from 1 April 2013 – 30 September 2013.

COMPANY NAME: APAC-Wississipp', Inc.

Continued on next page

COMPANY NAME: APAC-Wississippi, Inc.
ADDRESS: P.O. Box 24508
Jackson, 115 39225-4508
TELEPHONE: 601-376-4000
FAX NUMBER: 601-376-4055
EMAIL: john. may @ afac. Com
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE  3-19-13 DATE
TERRY WAY
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN

AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

## HAULING & LAYING OF ASPHALT TERM BID PERIOD 1 APRIL 2013 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2013

## ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 25 MARCH 2013

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE SECOND FLOOR, ROOMS 225-227 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

#### BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

This term bid is for Hauling & Laying of BB1 and SC1 Asphalt for selected road projects to be undertaken by Madison County. This term bid does not apply to specifically advertised and bid road construction projects in which a contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from exactly a designated asphalt will be paid for distance from asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling	2 O 50	per ton-mile
Laying	\$13.20	per ton
The below signed company agrees that if it Madison County Board of Supervisors for Hat it will provide said services in a timely price for the duration of the term bid period, 30 September 2013.	Hauling and Layi manner at the av	ng of Asphalt varded term bid
COMPANY NAME: Dickerson & Bou	was Inc.	
Continued on next page		

COMPANY NAME:	Dickerson & Bower Dra	
ADDRESS:	P.O. Box 1008	
	Brookhaver, Ms. 39602	
TELEPHONE:	(Goil 969-2002	
FAX NUMBER:	(607) 969-2004	
EMAIL:	longlenne bellsouth. net	,
AUTHORIZED REPRI	ESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	<u>3/25//3</u> DATE
7.1.11	and do a second	

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2013 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2013.

## ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 25 MARCH 2013

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

SC 1 Type II Asphalt			_ per ton
BB 1 Asphalt			_ per ton
Cold Mix			_ per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delive **Pricing based on delivery of full truck training to the unloading time. After two hours, we will be added to above price at a rate of \$. ROAD RECLAMATION (P.)	nsport quantities. FC charge \$75.00 per h 00133/gal for all emi	our for demurrage. Fed ulsion loads.	eral Environmental Fe
4 (four) inch depth		per square	yard
8 (eight) inch depth		per square	yard
12 (twelve) inch depth		per square	yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth		per square	yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth		per square	yard
COMPANY NAME: Continued on next page	ERGON ASPHA	LT & EMULSIONS,	INC.

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the Madison County Road Department: \_approximately 65 \_ Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period, which runs from 1 March 2013 – 30 September 2013. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:	ERGON ASPHALT & EMULSIONS, INC.	
ADDRESS:	P. O. BOX 23028	****
	JACKSON, MS 39225-3028	
TELEPHONE:	(601) 933-3000	
FAX NUMBER:	(601) 933-3363	
EMAIL:	Amy.Walker@ergon.com	***
Amy L. Wa	Cher	March 18, 2013
AUTHÓRIZED REP	RESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE
Amy L. Walker, Area Sal	es Manager	
PRINTED AUTHOR	IZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME	HERE



12251 Bernard Parkway, Suite 200, Gulfport, MS 39503

March 15, 2013

Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office Madison County Chancery Courthouse Second Floor 146 West Center Street Canton, MS 39046

RE: Bid for Asphalt & Asphalt-Related Products & Services

Attn: Chancery Clerk:

Please find enclosed the bid for Madison County for Liquid Asphalt CRS-2 from Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc.

Bid is for a six (6) month period starting on April 1, 2013 to September 30, 2013. Said bid is due to open March 25, 2013 at 10 a.m.

Please feel free to call us at 228-863-3878 should you have any questions.

Sincerely,

JR Wood

Area Sales Manager

Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc.

601-209-437x

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2013 – 30 SEPTEMBER 2013.

## ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 25 MARCH 2013

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK'S OFFICE MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR 146 WEST CENTER STREET CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

SC 1 Type II Asphalt		_ per ton	
BB 1 Asphalt		_ per ton	
Cold Mix		_per ton	
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered	1.98 2.14		
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will b	oe pre square ya	rd)	
4 (four) inch depth	per square	yard	
8 (eight) inch depth	per square	yard	
12 (twelve) inch depth	per square	yard	1959 than
18 (eighteen) inch depth	per square	yard	15 10 f exten
24 (twenty-four) inch depth	per square	yard	Par gal for
COMPANY NAME: Blacklidge Continued on next page	Emulsions		15 10 gal 15 10 gal 15 10 g gxthin per gal for Greight por The Woods 26 March 201

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the Madison County Road Department: \_\_\_\_\_/Z >\_ Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period, which runs from 1 March 2013 – 30 September 2013. The below signed company further agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: Blacklidge Emulsions	
ADDRESS: 12251 Bernard Parkway Suit	te 200
Gaffpart, MS 37503	MARKA AND AND AND AND AND AND AND AND AND AN
TELEPHONE: 228-863-3878	
FAX NUMBER: 214 - 864 - 0437	
EMAIL: jrwood@be-ine.com	
Middle	3-15-13
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE
JR Wood	
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME	HERE